
On 01-20-2020, at approximately 1205 Hours, I made contact with Dakota Wood at the Cass County Sheriff's Office on a
Cass County warrant. I served Cass County warrant 20CA-CR00075 for Harassment-2nd Degree. Bond was set at
Signature Bond.

01/20/20 12:05 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/20/2020 at approximately 1219 hours, I was dispatched to 321 N 3rd Street in Drexel in regards to a burglary. I
made contact with Stefani A. Duncan, who had called and stated her house was broken into. My investigation revealed
nothing criminal had taken place.

01/20/20 12:17 321 3RD ST, DREXEL

On 01/20/2020 at approximately 1419 hours, I made contact with Myron L. Jackson, who stated that he was bitten by a
dog at 22411 S. Deer Run Rd. A report was taken.

01/20/20 13:25 22411 DEER RUN RD, PECULIAR

Report number was taken for a gas drive off but customer returned during the investigation and paid for the gas.

01/20/20 14:56 17419 STATE ROUTE 291, PLEASANT HILL

On 01/20/2020 the Cass County Sheriff's Office Criminal Apprehension Unit K9 assisted the Peculiar Police Department
with a narcotics investigation. A suspect was identified by Peculiar PD.

01/20/20 16:10 625 PECULIAR DR, PECULIAR

On January 20, 2020 The Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a traffic stop on Laredo Trail near Laredo Court,
Raymore, Missouri. The driver, Micheal Williams, was arrested on Grandview, Missouri warrant 190006536 for traffic
offense with a bond of $260. The passenger, Hailey Tittle, w/f, was arrested on Belton, Missouri warrants 19B04315 and
19B042327 for traffic offenses each with a bond of $150. Mr. Williams was transported the the Grandview Police
Department and Ms. Tittle was transported to the Belton Police Department for further processing.

01/20/20 20:19  LAREDO TRL/LAREDO CT, RAYMORE

On Monday 1/20/19 at approximately 2134 hours I responded to 26510 S Coble Rd Peculiar Missouri in regards to a 911
hang up. No contact was made at the residence.

01/20/20 21:34 26510 COBLE RD, PECULIAR

On Tuesday 01/21/2020 at approximately 0034 hours, I conducted a vehicle stop at 7 highway and P highway in
Pleasant Hill, Mo. I contacted the driver identified as Weisz, Riley S. Mr. Weisz was arrested for active Warrants #
18037959 for failure to appear on traffic violations and #180379594 for failure to appear on traffic violations with a total
bond of $400 cash or surety out of Lake Winnebago Police Department.

01/21/20 00:34  7 HIGHWAY/ P HIGHWAY, PLEASANT HILL

On 01/21/2020 at approximately 0820 hours, I was dispatched to 12 S Water St, Liberty, Missouri in reference to a
warrant service. John Morgan was taken into custody on active Cass County warrant # 16CA-CR00885 for Failure to
Appear on Non-Support. Bond was set at $5,000.00 cash only. Mr. Morgan was transported to the Cass County Jail
without incident.

01/21/20 08:20 12 WATER ST, LIBERTY
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On January 19, 2019 at approximately 1945 hours, my issued patrol vehicle sustained damage from Harrisonville Police
Department attempting to make entry into the vehicle due to being locked out of the vehicle.

01/21/20 08:23 1707 ANN AV, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/21/2020, at approximately 0830 Hours, I made contact with Jeffery Vanslyke at the Cass County Sheriff's Office
on a Cass County warrant. I served Cass County warrant 20-CAFTA-24 for DWI-Alcohol, Fail to drive within single lane
on roadway having 3 or more lanes, Owner operate motor vehicle without maintaining financial responsibility or operate
who authorized to operate motor vehicle without financial responsibility. Bond was set at $300.00 cash only and a court
date of 02/04/2020 at 0900 hours was given.

01/21/20 08:30 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01-21-2020, at approximately 1041 hours, I was dispatched to 1003 N. Mullen Ave, Raymore in reference to a check
the welfare.  The subject was evaluated and received medical treatment.

01/21/20 10:40 1003 MULLEN AVE, RAYMORE

On 01/21/2020, at approximately 1100 Hours, I made contact with Joshua S. Griggs at the Cass County Sheriff's Office
on a Cass County warrant. I served three Cass County warrants 19CA-CR01282, 19CA-CR00842, 19CA-CR0218, and
19CA-CR00826 all for Failure to Appear.

01/21/20 11:33 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/21/2020, at approximately 1100 Hours, I made contact with Richard Glaze at the Cass County Sheriff's Office on
a Cass County warrant. I served Cass County warrant 19ca-cr01426 for Failure to Appear.

01/21/20 11:41 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

01/21/20 11:42 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On January 21, 2020 at approximately 1347 hours, I was dispatched to 31210 S State Route 7, Garden City MO, in
reference to a possible disturbance in progress. Disturbance was found to be verbal only both parties were seperated.

01/21/20 13:47 31210 STATE ROUTE 7, GARDEN CITY

On 11/21/2020, at approximately 1520 Hours, I made contact with Logan R Conner at the Cass County Sheriff's Office
on a Cass County warrant. I served Cass County after hours warrant for Domestic Assault 1st degree - 1st offense, and
Armed Criminal Action. Bond was set at $25,000.00 10% Cash only, and a court date of 03/19/2020 at 0900 hours was
given.

01/21/20 15:23 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01-21-2020, at approximately 1533 hours, I was dispatched to 37508 E. North St., Gunn City, in reference to a
stealing.  A suspect was identified.

01/21/20 15:31 37508 NORTH ST, GUNN CITY

Report was assigned was not needed on a follow up phone call to an earlier call.

01/21/20 18:18  PHONE CALL ONLY, UNKNOWN
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On 01/21/2020, at approximately 0952, I emailed the an application/affidavit for a search warrant in relation to Cass
County Sheriff's Office incident report number 200265 to Bianca Wagner with the Cass County Prosecutor's Office.  This
application was then sent to Judge Rumley for review. The application was reviewed and at approximately 2204 on
01/21/2020, Cass County search after hours warrant was signed by the honorable Judge Rumley. After hours Search
warrant was executed on 01/22/2020. For further information, refer to incident report number 200265.

01/21/20 21:00 28108 245TH STREET, EAST LYNNE

On 01/21/2020 at approximately 1915 hours, I made contact with Angela Christine Dooley at the Cass County Jail. I
served Ms. Dooley Cass County Warrant #19-17FTA-480 for Failure to Appear on a charge of Failure to Register
Vehicle, and Cass County Warrant 19-17FTA-481 for Failure to Appear on a charge of Driving While Revoked Or
Suspended. I gave Ms. Dooley a court date of 02/13/2020 at 1330 hours.

01/21/20 21:00 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On Wednesday 1/22/20 at approximately 0236 hours I responded to 18501 S. Barryfield Ln Belton Missouri on a medical
call. Roger C. Thompson, W/M, was found deceased in the home.

01/22/20 02:31 18501 BARRYFIELD LN, BELTON

On 01-22-20 at approximately 1047 hours, I met with McCoy, Donna K w/f who reported that several attempts were
made to open bank accounts in her name.  No suspect(s) have been identified.

01/22/20 10:44 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/22/2020 at approximately 1220 hours, I was dispatched to 1300 Cherry St, Kansas City, Missouri in reference to a
warrant service. Corey Mayer was taken into custody on active Cass County warrant # 18CA-CR00277 for Failure to
Appear on Possession of Controlled Substance. Bond was set at $10,000.00 cash only. Mr. Mayer was transported to
the Cass County Jail without incident.

01/22/20 12:20 1300 CHERRY ST, KANSAS CITY

On January 23, 2020 the Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a prisoner transfer from the Henry County Sheriff's
Office located at 200 N Main Street in Clinton, MO. Matthew Lindsey, w/m, was arrested on Cass County warrant
20CA-CR00110 for Rape/Attempt Rape with a bond of $35,000 10% cash only and a court date of March 19, 2020 at
0900 hours. Mr. Lindsey was transported to the Cass County Jail for further processing.

01/22/20 12:37 200 MAIN ST, CLINTON

This report is an administrative entry to log and validate stolen items from reports that were taken by the Garden City
Police Department.

01/22/20 13:14 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

01/22/20 14:49 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01-22-2020 at 1736 hours, the Cass County Criminal Apprehension Unit spoke with Debra Davidson on the
telephone in reference to an incident that occurred on 01-21-2020 in the Baldwin Lake area.  A report was made.

01/22/20 20:26 6 MURRAY RD, PLEASANT HILL

On 01-22-2020 at 2034 hours, the Cass County Sheriff's Office Criminal Apprehension Unit was dispatched to 12 Murray
Rd., Pleasant Hill, MO in reference to a disturbance between a male and a female with the female leaving the area on
foot.  Contact was made with a female who advised that she was not assaulted.  The female was given a courtesy ride
from the area.

01/22/20 20:31 12 MURRAY RD, PLEASANT HILL

Incident Log

FORM 3000 - Press Reports = UPDATED 01-24-11

© 1994 - 2019 Omnigo Software St. Louis MO  omnigo.com



Rd., Pleasant Hill, MO in reference to a disturbance between a male and a female with the female leaving the area on
foot.  Contact was made with a female who advised that she was not assaulted.  The female was given a courtesy ride
from the area.

On 01/22/2020, at approximately 2220 hours, I made contact with Mattox, Stephen Andrew in the Cass County Sheriff's
Office Jail on a Cass County warrant. I served an after-hours Cass County warrant for Rape or Attempted Rape - 1st
Degree and Sodomy or Attempted Sodomy - 1st Degree.

01/22/20 21:21 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 1/22/20 at approximately 2124 hours, I was dispatched to 12210 E. 250th in rural Peculiar, Mo for a report of a 911
hang up. Contact was made with John Norman who stated he had been assaulted. One party was taken into custody.

01/22/20 21:21 12210 250TH ST, PECULIAR

On Wednesday January 22, 2020 I was dispatched to 501 Lake Rd in Garden City. In reference to a violation of a Full
Order of Protection. Amie Moloski told dispatch that a male subject was at her residence that she has a Full Order of
Protection on. One male party was taken into custody after being located at another residence in Garden City.

01/22/20 22:50 501 LAKE RD, GARDEN CITY

On 01/23/2020 at approximately 2332 the Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a vehicle stop on a black, Ford Focus
on Southbound I-49 near mile marker 164. The driver Adam S. Yohe, W/M, fled the vehicle on foot and was soon after
taken into custody on the following active Cass County warrants: 19-CAFTA-483 for Failure To Appear Possession Of
Controlled Substance Except 35 Grams Or Less Of Marijuana/Synthetic Cannabinoid with a bond of $10,000.00 Cash
Only and 19-CAFTA-484 for Failure To Appear Possession Of Controlled Substance Except 35 Grams Or Less Of
Marijuana/Synthetic Cannabinoid, Possession Of Marijuana/Synthetic Cannabinoid of 10 Grams Or Less - Prior Drug
Offense, Unlawful Possession Of Drug Paraphernalia - Prior Drug Offense with a bond of $10,000.00 Cash Only. Mr.
Yohe was also taken into custody on the following additional active warrants: Probation and Parole - Parole Violation -
Three Counts of Possession of Controlled Substance Except 35 Grams Or Less Of Marijuana with no bond allowed,
Belton Police Department warrants: #19004370 for Expired Plates, #19004371 Failure To Yield For Emergency Vehicle,
#19004372 No Proof Of Insurance, #19004373 Speeding with a total bond of $900.00 Cash Or Surety and Harrisonville
Police Department warrants for Failure To Appear: #190001255 Failure to Signal, #19000124 Failure To Yield To
Emergency Vehicle, #190001246 Possession Of Drug Paraphernalia, #190001242 Expired Vehicle License,
#190001245 Resist Arrest, #19000143 Failure To Drive In Single Lane, #190001241 Defective Equipment with a total
bond of $1432.00 Cash Or Surety.  A female passenger was also taken into custody for Possession Of Drug
Paraphernalia.

01/22/20 23:16  I49 SB MM164, HARRISONVILLE

On Thursday January 23, 2020 at approximately 0214 hours, I was dispatched to 26519 S Blinker Light road in
Harrisonville. After speaking with the reporting party Terrie P S Murphy, it was found that nothing criminal took place
during the incident.

01/23/20 02:10 26519 BLINKER LIGHT RD, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/23/2020, at approximately 0721 hours I was dispatched to 101 Main St, Garden City, Missouri in reference to an
animal call.  Upon my arrival I located a raccoon that appeared injured or sick.

01/23/20 07:19 101 MAIN ST, GARDEN CITY

On 01/23/2020 at approximately 0910 hours, I was dispatched to 107 S 4th St, Mound City, Kansas in reference to a
warrant service. Michael Strup was taken into custody on active Cass County warrant # 17CA-CR00476 for Failure to
Appear on Driving While Revoked/Suspended and Failure to Register Motor Vehicle. Bond was set at $5,000.00 cash
only. Mr. Strup was transported to the Cass County Jail without incident.

01/23/20 09:10 107 4TH ST, MOUND CITY
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Appear on Driving While Revoked/Suspended and Failure to Register Motor Vehicle. Bond was set at $5,000.00 cash
only. Mr. Strup was transported to the Cass County Jail without incident.

On 1/23/2020 at approximately 0910 hours while working at the checkpoint I came into contact with Blum, Michael in
reference to possession of drug paraphernalia in the courthouse.

01/23/20 10:00 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/23/2020 at approximately 1111 hours deputies were dispatched to the area of 275th and Bell Plain Rd for two
subjects walking in the road and possibly involved in a verbal disturbance. While checking the area I located a male and
a female walking on 275th St. A check of the subjects revealed the male subject was giving a false name and had active
warrants out of Cass County and Bates County. Gary Knowels was arrested for Cass County Warrant #19-CAFTA-7,
Possession of Controlled Substance x2, Bond $5,000.00 Cash Only. Bates County Warrants #10BSCR0009201,
Non-Support, Bond $10,000.00 10% Cash and #18BSCR00183, Passing Bad Checks, Bond $750 Cash Only. Mr.
Knowles was taken into custody.

01/23/20 11:07  275TH/BELLE PLAIN, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/23/2020, at approximately 1521 Hours, I made contact with Dakota F L Gorham at the Cass County Sheriff's
Office on a Cass County warrant. I served Cass County warrant 703055279.

01/23/20 12:02 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01-23-2020 at approximately 1229 hours I was dispatched to 1005 Butler terr Harrisonville for civil process. At
approximately 1246 hours I arrived on scene and made contact with Shawn Leslie at the front door. I served Mr. Leslie a
Cass County notice of hearing. I then advised Mr. Leslie that he had a active warrant out of Highway Patrol. Mr. Leslie
was transported to the Cass County jail with out incident.

01/23/20 12:29 1005 BUTLER DR, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/23/2020 at approximately 1250 hours, I responded to E-block in the Cass County Jail, in Harrisonville in regards
to a fight in progress. The fight was broken up and the parties were separated.

01/23/20 13:03 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/23/2020, at approximately 1420 Hours, I made contact with Christian Nichols W/M at the Cass County Sheriff's
Office on a Cass County warrant. I served Cass County warrant After Hours.

01/23/20 13:25 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 1/24/20 at approximately 0548 hours, I was dispatched to the Belton Police Department for a prisoner transfer. I
contacted Daelynn Bookout at the Belton Jail, and took her into custody on Cass warrant #17CA-CR00154-01 for
Possession of Controlled Substance Except 35 Grams or Less of Marijuana. The warrant showed a bond of $5,000
Cash Only, and a court date of 3/19/20 at 1330 hours. Ms. Bookout was transported to the Cass County Jail where she
was released to jail deputies for further processing.

01/23/20 13:31 7001 163RD ST, BELTON

On 01/23/2020 at approximately 1027 hours, I was dispatched to 20509 S. State Route J regarding a Non Caretaker
Referral, the subject in question was contacted.

01/23/20 15:33 20509 STATE ROUTE J, PECULIAR

On January 23, 2020 hours, the Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a vehicle stop in the area of southbound
Interstate 49 and Commercial in Harrionsville, Missouri on a red in color Ford Expedition as the driver had a revoked
operators status. Mark Cobb was arrested on Cass County warrant #19CA-CR01192 for Fail to Appear Possession of a
Controlled Substance and Driving While Revoked with a total bond of $5,000, 10% cash only and Johnson County
warrant #20JOCR00013 for Possession of a Controlled Substance with a total bond of $3,000, cash only. Mr. Cobb was
transported to the Cass County Jail for processing.

01/23/20 15:52  SB 49/COMMERCIAL, HARRISONVILLE
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operators status. Mark Cobb was arrested on Cass County warrant #19CA-CR01192 for Fail to Appear Possession of a
Controlled Substance and Driving While Revoked with a total bond of $5,000, 10% cash only and Johnson County
warrant #20JOCR00013 for Possession of a Controlled Substance with a total bond of $3,000, cash only. Mr. Cobb was
transported to the Cass County Jail for processing.

On 01/23/2020 at approximately 1730 hours, an inmate of the Cass County Jail attempted self harm. The inmate was
evaluated by medical staff and subsequently placed in the restraint chair for his safety.

01/23/20 17:19 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01-23-2020, at 1913 hours, the Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a vehicle check at 625 Peculiar Dr, Peculiar. I
contacted Tanner Ferrari who was arrested for active Cass County warrant 20CA-CR00127 for Possession of a
Controlled Substance, with a bond amount of $5000.00 10% cash only. The warrant was issued with a court date of
03-19-2020, at 0900 hours. Mr. Ferrari was transported to the Cass County Jail for processing.

01/23/20 19:13 625 PECULIAR DR, PECULIAR

On 01-24-2020, at 0004 hours, The Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a vehicle stop at 1901 W. Mechanic St,
Harrisonville. A male suspect was contacted and arrested for a narcotic violation. The suspect was transported to the
Cass County Jail.

01/24/20 00:04 1901 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On January 24, 2019 at approximately 0915 hours, I observed a vehicle that slid off the the roadway on the east side of
northbound 7 highway just south of 219th street. No injuries were reported on scene.

01/24/20 09:15  NB 7/219TH ST, PLEASANT HILL

On 01/24/2020, at approximately 1149 hours, I was dispatched to a disturbance at 36004 E. 58 Hwy, Pleasant Hill.  Prior
to my arrival, Ronald G. Tallen, w/m, left the residence.  Shyann K. Tallen, w/f, remained at the residence for an
additional deputy to arrive.

01/24/20 11:48 36004 STATE ROUTE 58, PLEASANT HILL

On 01/24/2020 at approximately 1253 hours, I was dispatched to 16856 Highland ridge Dr. Loch Lloyd in regards to a
medical call. My investigation revealed nothing criminal took place.

01/24/20 12:50 16856 HIGHLAND RIDGE DR, VILLAGE OF LOCH LLOY

On January 24, 2019 at approximately 1510 hours, I was dispatched to 200 Main St, Garden City MO, in reference to a
stealing that occurred between 01/21/2020 and 01/22/2020.

01/24/20 15:10 200 MAIN ST, GARDEN CITY

On 01/24/2020, at approximately 1730 hours, I conducted at traffic stop at 160th St ad Ward Rd. The driver and
occupant were arrested on outside agency warrants

01/24/20 17:27  WARD/160TH ST, RAYMORE

On Friday, January 24th, 2020, at approximately 2058 hours, I was dispatched to 720 Cardinal St, Pleasant Hill, for a
stealing. On scene, I contacted Kerri Kunkel, who stated he had a trailer and other items taken from his property. No
suspects have been identified.

01/24/20 19:59 720 CARDINAL ST, PLEASANT HILL
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On Friday, January 24th, 2020, at approximately 2236 hours, I was dispatched to 5801 E 187th St, unit #76, Belton, for a
burglary in progress. On scene, I contacted Pamela White and Robert Cagney, who observed two parties enter and take
items from an unoccupied trailer. Two suspects have been identified and are in custody.

01/24/20 22:34 5801 187TH ST, BELTON

On 01-25-20 at 1050 hours, I responded to the Scott County Detention Center 100 W 1st St , Waldron, AR 72958
reference a warrant service. I then took Demetrius Shytuan Hill into custody on Cass County warrant #
17CA-CR01167-01 for Warrant Arrest (Probation Violation), bond $25,000.00 cas or court approved surety, Mr Hill was
transported to the Cass County Jail.

01/25/20 05:40 100 1ST ST, WALDRON

On January 25, 2020 at approximately 1028 hours, I conducted a vehicle check on 307th Street just west of State Route
T Highway. I observed the vehicle to be unoccupied and parked fully in the west bound lane of traffic on 307th Street.
The vehicle was towed due to being parked in the west bound lane of traffic.

01/25/20 10:28  307/T HWY, GARDEN CITY

On Saturday 01/25/2020, at approximately 1848 Hours, I made contact with Furnas, Jeramie W. at the Belton Police
Department 7001 E. 163rd Street, on a Cass County warrant. I arrested Mr. Furnas on an after hours warrant for Forgery
with a Bond of $15,000 cash only.

01/25/20 11:57 7001 163RD ST, BELTON

On 01/25/2020, at approximately 1235 hours, I made contact with Thomas Ward at the Cass County Jail on Cass
County warrant 19CA-CR01332 for possession of controlled substance. Bond was set at $5,000.00, 10% cash only, and
a court date of 04/09/2020 at 0900 hours was given.

01/25/20 12:27 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On 01-25-2020, at approximately 1215 hours, I responded to 28920 S. West Outer Rd., Harrisonville Mo, in reference to
stolen license plates.

01/25/20 12:56 28920 WEST OUTER RD, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/25/2020, at approximately 1304 hours, I arrived at Jackson County Missouri Corrections. I placed Rayket
Deshawn McCall B/M in custody for Cass County Warrant 19-CAFTA-948, Failure to Appear - Tampering with Motor
Vehicle - 1st Degree with a bond of $5000.00 cash-only. Mr. McCall was transported to the Cass County Jail.

01/25/20 14:14 1300 CHERRY ST, KANSAS CITY

On 01/25/2020 at approximately 1436 hours, I was dispatched to 13610 e 217th Terrace in Peculiar on a fraud/forgery
call. I made contact with Jackie W. Brewster, who stated that he received a bill from AT&T, for a cell phone account
opened in his name. He stated that he did not open the account. A report was taken.

01/25/20 14:30 13610 217TH TER, PECULIAR

On 01/25/2020 at approximately 1712 hours, I was dispatched to the Dollar General store in Freeman on a civil standby.
The standby was performed and a report was taken.

01/25/20 17:06 303 2ND ST, FREEMAN

On Saturday 01/25/2020 at approximately 2108 hours I responded to 25608 E. 58 Highway in regards to a medical call
which had turned into a disturbance. My investigation concluded a verbal non criminal domestic disturbance had
occurred.

01/25/20 20:16 25608 STATE ROUTE 58, PLEASANT HILL
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which had turned into a disturbance. My investigation concluded a verbal non criminal domestic disturbance had
occurred.

On 01/25/2020 at approximately 2232 hours, the Criminal Apprehension Unit conducted a pedestrian check on
Commercial St. near Independence St. in Harrisonville, MO. The pedestrain, Kenneth Brewer was arrested on Blue
Spring PD warrant W2000218 for FTA-Stealing. Bond was set at $1,000.00 Cash Only. Mr. Brewer was transported to
the Cass County Jail.

01/25/20 22:32  COMMERCIAL/INDEPENDENCE, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/26/2019, at approximately 0508 hours, I responded to the area between E 267th Street and E 273rd Street on S.
Blinker Light Road, Harrisonville, reference a suspicious subject banging on doors asking for gasoline. A vehicle was
located in the area of E 273rd and Tiemen Road that was related to this incident. We were unable to locate the subject
and a white Chrysler Pacifica was towed from the roadway.

01/26/20 04:52 26925 BLINKER LIGHT RD, HARRISONVILLE

On 01/26/2020, I made contact with an Inmate at the Cass County Sheriff's Office in regards to an assault that took
place. A suspect has been identified at this time.

01/26/20 05:00 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE

On January 26, 2019 at approximately 1004 hours, I attempted to conduct a vehicle stop at the intersection of 307th
Street and Sycamore Grove road. After activating my lights and sirens the vehicle failed to yield. Vehicle was pursured
into Johnson County MO where two subjects were taken into custody.

01/26/20 10:04  307TH ST/SYCAMORE GROVE RD, GARDEN CITY

On 01-26-2020, at approximately 1440 Hours, I made contact with Larry Donald Hibner, at the Cass County Sheriff's
Office on a Cass County warrant. I served Cass County warrant 18CA-CR01158 for Tampering with a Motor Vehicle - 1st
Degree.

01/26/20 14:28 2501 MECHANIC ST, HARRISONVILLE
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